
CITY OF CONCORD
CERTIFIED BID TABULATION FORM
STREETS PRESERVATION CONTRACT STR22a Bid No. 2539
LOCATION:    TRAFFIC MANAGEMENT CENTER, 880 WARREN C COLEMAN BLVD CONCORD, NC
TIME:        2:00 P.M.                   DATE:      June 7th 2022

Contractor
N.C. License No.
Address
City, State  Zip
5% Bid Bond Included

No. Item Units Quantity Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total

1.1 Seal Existing pavement cracks and joints lbs 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID

2.1

Asphalt Full Depth Finished Patching - Place and compact Intermediate 
Course 3" I19.0B with 2" Surface Course S9.5 B Cap (areas to be 
determined) Tons 0

- NO BID - NO BID -
NO BID

2.2
Asphalt Full Depth Patching - Place and compact  Intermediate Course 
I19.0B  (no Surface Course Cap) Tons 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

2.3 Asphalt Leveling - Place and compact  Intermediate Course I19.0B Tons 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

2.4
Asphalt Leveling - Place and compact Asphalt Open Graded Leveling 
Course (P78 or mix as approved by Director) Tons 3,565 $110.00 $392,150.00 $103.50 $368,977.50 $113.50 $404,627.50

2.5
Place and compact suitable Sub-base material  (Location to be 
determined) Cu. Yd 50 $100.00 $5,000.00 $104.50 $5,225.00 $100.00 $5,000.00

2.6 Asphalt Seal Coat Sq. Yd 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
$397,150.00 $374,202.50 $409,627.50

3.1 Full Mill the bituminous pavement - Depth 0” to 4”                 Sq. Yd 31,605 $2.80 $88,494.00 $2.25 $71,111.25 $2.15 $67,950.75
3.2 Edge Mill the bituminous pavement - Depth 0” to 4”      Sq. Yd 11,415 $3.50 $39,952.50 $2.25 $25,683.75 $2.20 $25,113.00
3.3 Incidental Milling  0” to 6” Sq. Yd 400 $12.00 $4,800.00 $2.25 $900.00 $7.50 $3,000.00

$133,246.50 $97,695.00 $96,063.75

4.1 Reclamation of existing roadway with concrete stabilization Sq. Yd 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

4.2
Undercut and replace with approved suitable material for subgrade 
repairs Tons 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

5.1
Asphalt Resurfacing - Place and compact 1.25” of Surface Course 
S9.5B Tons 2,035 $108.00 $219,780.00 $114.00 $231,990.00 $115.50 $235,042.50

5.2 Asphalt Resurfacing - Place and compact 1.5” of Surface Course S9.5B Tons 2,915 $103.00 $300,245.00 $114.00 $332,310.00 $115.50 $336,682.50
$520,025.00 $564,300.00 $571,725.00

6.1
City of Concord Standard Valley Type Concrete Curb and Gutter 
(Incidental and as directed: LF 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

6.2
City of Concord Standard 2’-6” Concrete Curb and Gutter (Incidental 
and as directed): LF 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

6.3 Wheelchair Ramps (Incidental and as directed: Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
6.4 4” Thick Concrete Sidewalk Sq. Yd 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

7.1 Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines 4”  Double Yellow Solid LF 27 $35.00 $945.00 $33.25 $897.75 $31.35 $846.45

7.2
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines 4”  Yellow Solid, Skip, and 
Mini Skip Line   LF 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.3 Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines 8" Yellow Gore Line LF 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.4
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines 4" White Solid, Skip, and Mini 
Skip and Parking Stall Line LF 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.5 Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines STOP Bar - 24”                          LF 16 $40.00 $640.00 $40.75 $652.00 $38.50 $616.00

7.6
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines Crosswalk - 8" White NCDOT 
Std. LF 0 $1.00 NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.7
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines Crosswalk, Hi-Visibility - 24" 
White Bars NCDOT Std. LF 0 4 NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.8 Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Yield Lane Symbol LF 0 - $0.00 - NO BID - NO BID

7.9
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Thur, Right-Turn or Left-
Turn Arrow Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.10
Thermoplastic Pavment Marking Symbol Combo Arrow - Thur-Rt. / 
Thru-Lf. / Thru Rt. & Lf. Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.11
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Characters 8'-4" NCDOT 
Std. Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.12
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band 
NCDOT Std. Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.13 Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.14
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane 
NCDOT Std. Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.15
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT 
Std. Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.16
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT 
Std. Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.17 Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
7.18 Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.19
Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant 
Locations Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.20 Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Crystal Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
7.21 (Match Exisiting) - "Fire Lane" Red Box with White Lettering Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

$1,585.00 $1,549.75 $1,462.45

$1,052,006.50 $1,037,747.25 $1,078,878.70
$105,200.65 $103,774.73 $107,887.87

$1,157,207.15 $1,141,521.98 $1,186,766.57

This Certified Bid Tabulation is true and correct to the best of my abilities and knowledge. 
(amounts rounded up to nearest $0.01)

Blythe Brothers Asphalt Co. 
LLC

42840
1415 E Westinghouse Blvd

Charlotte, NC 28273
Yes

Re-Striping, Remarking. And Replace Pavement Marker

Blythe Construction Inc.

TOTAL BASE BID 

Milling

Reclamation 

Concrete

This is to certify that bids tabulated herein were publicly opened and read aloud at 2:00 p.m. on 
April 18, 2022, in the conference room at the Brown Operations Center at 635 Alfred Brown Jr. Ct. 

SW, Concord, North Carolina.

7639
J.T. Russell & Sons, Inc.

2767

Albermarle, NC 28002

Crack and Joint Sealing

Patching, Leveling, Asphalt Seal Coating

Yes

PO Box 31635
Charlotte, NC 28231

BASE  BID SECTIONS SUBTOTAL

 + 10% CONTINGENCY

Yes

Resurfacing

PO Box 670


